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2001 12 05 Wednesday Dan Aykroyd   NASA 
    David B. Sereda 

 
AB: “David Sereda – last time he was on the show, we had a magnetic 

anomaly occur that took out all land-based microwave and satellite 
signals, including my satellite signal. …  It is the second time in the history 
of the program that ever happened.  Something took us out.  And I think 
intentionally.” 

 
 David Sereda (born in Edmonton, AB Canada) – meditation, “quest for 

God and answers to life’s most perplexing questions.”  Has worked as an 
environmentalist, has planted more than nine hundred thousand 
(900,000+) trees – Wow! 

 
 Dan Aykroyd – you know who he is, right?   Brilliant comedian!  Acted on 

Saturday Night Live for four (4) seasons.  Formed the Blues Brothers with 
John Belushi.  Numerous major movie appearances. 

 
DAVID SEREDA 

 
AB: “David, welcome back to the program!” 
 
DS: “Thanks for having me back.” 
 
AB: “By the way the last time you were on David, that was easily the second 

strangest thing that has ever happened on this program, and I personally 
believe it was intentional.” 

 
DS: “Well, you mentioned the following couple of nights that there could have 

been an NSA [National Security Agency] connection. …  The scientists 
that I had been speaking to at NASA [sic] that I know quite well, would 
never be speaking to me so openly in the future, so I decided to test that 
theory …” 

 
AB: “And?” … 
 
DS: “I asked them a really simple question – nothing about UFOs – just a very 

simple question, and they ignored me.  I didn’t get one answer. …  None 
of five (5) scientists I wrote ever spoke to me again, so that made me very, 
very suspicious.” 

 
* * * 

DAN AYKROYD 
 
AB: “Dan, welcome to the program …” 
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DA: “Hi Art, thanks very much.” 
 
AB: “God, it’s great to have you!” 
 
DA: “It’s wonderful to be on! …  Of course, I’m an avid listener, driving across 

country through the desert, through the Great Southwest of America, 
listening to your program is one of the peak experiences of life!” 

 
AB: “Boy, that is the way to do it.  At night, it’s dark, you’re on a road without 

many other cars and this kind of program will get right inside ya …” 
 
DA: “It’s really wonderful …  I’ve had people with me, and we’ve been just 

gripped for the hour or two that we’ve been able to receive you …” 
 
AB: “Hey, you’re going to be doing a program kind of like this, aren’t you?” 
 
DA: “Well, one can never do a program of the scope and quality of the Art Bell 

show in any medium I don’t think …” 
 
AB: “You are very kind, however …” 
 
DA: “I am attempting to catalogue on video on the Sci-Fi Channel and treat 

with the proper degree of respect and humor, and perhaps skepticism – 
some of the theories that have been put forth and put Out There (which is 
the name of the show) by the leading experts in the fields which I’ve been 
interested in I guess since being a teenager and being exposed to my 
father’s and my family’s interest in supernatural and paranormal 
occurrences. 

 
 Now this ranges from healers to the apparition at Fatima, to religious 

rapture, to spontaneous combustion – all of the things, Art, basically that 
interest us …” 

 
AB: “Yes …” 
 
DA: “As folkloric inquirers …  I’m not a scientist (and I’ll never say I am), but I 

am an entertainer and it is entertaining … and I am a folkloric researcher.  
So under that sort of umbrella, I think I’m going to be able to make some 
very interesting inquiries and have some fascinating guests on, and 
hopefully open up to get some answers, and maybe look where we’re 
going in the future as a species, as a body of spirits, and point to that fact 
that maybe there will be some positive revelation that will affect mankind 
in a positive sense.  God knows we need it today.” 

 
AB: “So you’ll probably touch base with a number of guests I’ve had on the 

program.” 
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DA: “No doubt.  Of course, I’ll get ’em on camera there and I will attempt to 

open up to the Sci-Fi audience … some of these ideas and hopefully 
expose some of these people … for commercial purposes to help them 
make a living.” 

 
AB: “Sure, sure …” 
 
DA: “The way that they’ve devoted their lives – like Steven Greer and Linda 

Moulton Howe – they’ve devoted their lives to this …” 
 
AB: “They sure have …” 
 
DA: “They should be compensated for their efforts and for their continuing 

research.  I’m happy to plug stuff like that.” 
 
AB: “Right.” 
 

* * * 
DA: “Anything you write can be created if you have enough labor, time, and 

money.” 
 
 “It’s a miracle how movies get made.” 
 
AB: “It is.  It is.” 
 
DA: “You have one hundred fifty (150) people coming together for three (3) 

months – all of different trades. …” 
 
 “It’s amazing how these films have come together!  I’ve just been qualified 

to work with the best people in my career!  My success is due to the 
people I’ve worked with.  It’s always great when you sit in that screening 
room – or with an audience, even better – and all the jokes are working, 
and all the moments are working – it’s the peak of creativity!  And I guess 
satisfaction as an artist.” 

 
AB: “Yeah, you really know when you’re on, don’t ’cha?” 
 
DA: “Umm … well, you hope you know when you’re shooting it …” 
 
AB: “Yeah, but you can feel it … when it’s clickin’, you can absolutely feel it!” 
 
DA: “You can feel it in an audience, yeah …  The personal experience of really 

feeling a performance click is when doing music, you know?  You come 
out there and you rip into a song and then the audience is up on their feet, 
and they’re there for the concert …!” 
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AB: “So that immediate feedback?” 
 
DA: “Yeah, that’s really great to do …” 
 

* * * 
DS: “The Hopi elders … tell us … that we’re now in the Fourth World – four (4) 

times we’ve reached this same peak of civilization and technology AND 
three (3) times in a row we chose the wrong road, because we chose not 
to live in harmony with Nature – the Earth in a sense had to protect itself 
and temporarily destroy mankind … humankind …” 

 
AB: “Yeah …” 
 
DS: “… And then the world would go through another Great Cycle.” 
 
 “Also, in India they have discovered a site – I can’t quote the exact 

location – but they have discovered a city that is covered by two or three 
inches of radioactive ash, that is over twelve thousand (12,000) years old.  
And we wonder how could an area that large be surrounded by a 
radioactive layer of ash twelve thousand (12,000) years old?  The only 
answer would be a nuclear explosion (!)” … 

 
AB: “Do both of you think that the human race could handle understanding that 

others have been here with virtually all of the evidence of their existence 
almost erased?  Almost, not quite, erased?  Do you think the human race 
could understand and grasp the fact that it’s not as we have believed it to 
be all our lives?” 

 
DS: “I think a lot of people could.  I think people need to see evidence. …” 
 
AB: “And some couldn’t!” 
 
DS: “And some couldn’t.” 
 

* * * 
AB: “Dan … a lot of people are asking about Psi Factor – they loved it!” 
 
DA: “Well, to address your first question regarding whether the human race is 

ready for revelation, I would say that fifty percent (50%) is ready – half is 
ready …” 

 
AB: “That’s not enough.” 
 
DA: “No, but the other half has to be introduced to such stuff and I guess that’s 

why …” 
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AB: “You’re doing it?” 
 
DA: “We do this. … And Psi Factor was the outgrowth of a case file that my 

brother and I found, which was the property of a technology company …” 
 DA claims one of the cases involved sending a paper clip through a 

[worm]hole from Argentina to China (!) 
 

* * * 
AB: “If we can live forever virtually, then we can get to the stars.” 
 

* * * 
AB: “Dan, have you seen a UFO?  Have you seen something that you 

absolutely, simply cannot explain?” 
 
DA: “Yes, I have.” 
 
AB: “I’ve heard that rumor.  What have you seen?” 
 
DA: “Well, I’d like to preface all of this by saying there’s something very 

comforting in all of this to me and that is that ‘All of It’ – the Multiverse / 
Everything – these creatures, whether we are linked, belong to some 
interdimensional species or some extraterrestrial species – ‘All of It’  
comes and was created by a God or the Godhead or the Cosmic Engineer 
– a Great Divine Being.” 

 
 “I’m not a Fundamentalist … I’m a lapsed Catholic, altar boy, ex-

Seminarian – but I do believe that there is a Divine Presence behind all of 
it.  David, what do you think?” 

 
DS: I’ve had experiences that confirm that there is a Supreme Creator behind 

all of this. 
 
AB: “You’re very lucky.” 
 
DA: “And whatever that Creator might be, he certainly facilitated the 

technological advance that I was witness to. 
 
 From my stone terrace at my house in Martha’s Vineyard at 3 a.m. one 

night at about fifty thousand (50,000) feet [the same height as the 
Concorde], … I saw two glowing white disks side-by-side flying tandem or 
edge-to-edge or wing-to-wing, completely round, completely white, and 
luminous.  They crossed the southeast horizon right across the sky to the 
northwest in about twenty (20) seconds.  They were really, really movin’.  
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 This was not a helicopter, not Venus, not the North Star, not the ’Kite 
Formation’ …” 

 
AB: “Sure.” 
 
DA: “And I called my wife out, and I called my friend Larry out, and I called his 

girlfriend out, and the four of us saw these disks go across.  Now this is 
way high up and they were little dots, but they weren’t a satellite … it 
wasn’t the space shuttle.  It was something going really fast, probably 
fifteen thousand (15,000) miles per hour (mph).” 

 
AB: “Once you’ve seen something like that [as I have on two occasions], life is 

never going to be quite the same, is it?” 
 
DA: “Well, it makes for exciting conversation and exciting sort of reaffirmation 

on why we should go out at night and watch the skies, and witness things 
in the heavens that are there naturally, and perhaps … unnaturally.  It was 
very exciting, and of course, to this day I relate that experience and still 
get a tingle thinking about the moment that I saw that, and now I can turn 
to my wife and she can turn to me when someone brings up this 
conversation or you know, this subject and we can say we’ve had this 
experience – we believe that there’s something there – some species that 
has this technological ability.” 

 
AB: “After you saw this did you debate with yourself and the others who saw it 

about public disclosure?” 
 
DA: “Umm … whether we should publicly disclose?” 
 
AB: “That’s right.” 
 
DA: “Well, at that point you know, they were so high up, it wasn’t as if they 

were disturbing air traffic.  And they weren’t a threat, they weren’t a harm, 
also …” 

 
AB: “Oh no, I just meant going to the public in whatever venue and admitting 

that you have seen something that is …” 
 
DA: “At that time I didn’t really have an arena to do it … I didn’t really have a 

voice – I … I should have called your show and gone on, I guess …  I just 
really didn’t have an outlet to really discuss it, but of course I’ve talked 
about it with many people …  It’s just great to have a real point of 
reference and say:  ‘Hey, I’ve shared in something like this.’” 

 
AB: “Well, there is a certain danger of course in going public, and saying this 

sort of thing, and I thought pretty hard about it even though I do this kind 
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of program when I saw [what I saw] … and I thought kind of hard about it 
because people have an attitude although that is now changing.” 

 
DA: “It is changing, although there’s a tremendous document – the Rockefeller 

Report – and of all the anecdotes and that’s a firsthand reference, you 
know, and Steven Greer’s work, and all of that I think is going to open 
things up.  There’s so many people …” 

 
AB: “Have you met Steven Greer?” 
 
DA: “I have not.” 
 
AB: “He’s an amazing man, just amazing.  And absolutely driven.  That’s the 

only word you can use to describe Steven Greer.”  [Charlatan! – JS] 
 

* * * 
AB: “Do you believe we’re being visited by extraterrestrials?” 
 
DA: “I do.  I believe that extradimensionals, extraterrestrials … I believe that 

we are being visited by beings in possession of a superior, advanced 
futuristic technology that enables them to wink in and out of beyond a 
Fourth Dimension that we perceive every day and possibly bend gravity to 
skip through Time and David [Sereda]’s book has an extraordinary theory 
about how this would be technically and scientifically possible.” … 

 
 “People say:  ‘Where’s the proof, Dan?  Where’s the evidence?’  Well, you 

know there’s paintings, there’s new photos, there’s [an] extraordinary 
amount of videotape now that you can get … and these things on 
videotape – it’s not helicopters, it’s not Venus …”  

 
AB: “No.” 
 
DA: “It’s not the Moon …” 
 
AB: “No.” 
 
DA: “It’s these machines.  Now is it us in the future coming back to re-engineer 

our DNA to make us stronger in the future?” 
 
AB: “Possible.” 
 
DA: “Or is it a foreign species in a foreign star system, and I think that David  

[Sereda]’s book presents very plausible and believable, and compelling 
evidence that we are being visited by a benevolent and beneficent 
species, that really cares about us and our environment.” 
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AB: “Well they must or we’d already be gone.  They certainly would have the 
power if they can do what they’re doing, whether it’s traverse dimensions 
or traverse the amount of space required to get here.  They could instantly 
get rid of us if they really wanted to, so the question is:  What are they 
doing?  Observing?  This is for either one of you …  Do you think they are 
observing?  Do you think they will step in at some point if we’re about to 
wink ourselves out?  Or why have they not contacted us after all?” 

 
DA: “Well, they … you know, some species are abducting people all the time.” 
 
AB: “Yeah, I know …” 
 
DA: “They don’t feel it’s invasive.  They’ve been given knowledge, they’ve 

been given information, they’ve been given insight into why the particular 
species of being that abducted them came to do so. …  David, tell Art and 
I [and the listeners out there] what is a ‘Dropa Stone’?  What does it look 
like?  What is its significance in world culture?” 

 
DS: “First of all, a Chinese professor named Chi Pu Tei in 1938 led an 

archaeology team of Tibetan and Chinese archaeologists into the high 
mountains of Baian Kara-Ula on the Tibetan-Chinese border, and that’s 
1938.  They found the skeletal remains of what appeared to be tiny people 
with large, bulbous heads in a gravesite with interlocking caves, and that’s 
an image I think that stands out in everybody’s mind.” 

 
DA: “And where was that again?” 
 
DS: “That’s on the border of Tibet and China in the mountains of Baian Kara-

Ula, Professor Chi Pu Tei in 1938.  Now then, when they go through the 
gravesite, they find these round stones – round discs – they’re quite large, 
maybe two feet in diameter roughly …  They find seven hundred sixteen 
(716) of them.  They’re round, they have a hole in the center, a notch … 
many of them have a notch cut out of the side, and they have a spiraling 
groove of closely written characters – not unlike (aka like) hieroglyphics, 
that actually were later translated.” 

 
DA: “Like a Lifesaver with a notch out of it?” 
 
DS: “Exactly.  And so what does this mean?  We know that ancient civilizations 

and ancient people recorded history in stone.  That’s how ancient people 
recorded their history – the same way we record things on paper and then 
on computers today.” 

 
 “So what did it mean?  And basically what happened is there were two (2) 

answers that came …”  One Chinese translator was banished from his 
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university in 1962 when he was about to publish his translation of the 
Dropa Stone. 

 
AB: “And what was that?  What was he going to say?” 
 
DS: “He was going to say the translation revealed that these round disks were 

emulations of giant spacecraft that crash landed in these mountains 
twelve thousand (12,000) years ago, and actually described these burning 
disks …” 

 
DA: “They were replicas, like miniature replicas of …” 
 
DS: “They were miniature replicas of the craft that came crash landing into the 

mountains and then they found these small people from another star 
system.  Then the answer [?] was where are the people from …?  There’s 
not a lot written of them other than the fact they crash landed from another 
star system … 

 
 Inside of the caves they had little pea-sized dots connecting between stars 

and the Earth, so these pea-sized dots were theoretically telling us where 
the origin of these ancient peoples were from. 

 
 In 1947, an English scientist named Dr. Karyl Robin-Evans went in, under 

an audience from the fourteenth (14th) Dalai Lama (our current Dalai 
Lama).  He got an audience with him and then he went to study the local 
tribespeople in the area, learned the language, and then he learned of an 
old tribesman named ‘Lergon Law’ [sic?] that this crashed saucer and 
these ancient peoples came from the star system of Sirius twelve 
thousand (12,000) years ago.  So then we got an answer what a dropa 
stone was, what it emulated, and where this ancient civilization was from.  
So we get a connection to a star system.” 

 
DA: “And so I bring that up just first to get an image out there of this stone with 

that significance and then ‘cut to’ modern technology today – the space 
shuttle … Mission Number Seventy-Nine (79), was it not?” 

 
DS: “The STS Seventy-Five (75) – February 1996.” 
 
DA: “Okay, which on board there are numerous recording devices – audio and 

video for the work of the astronauts, and for ground control and 
monitoring.” 

 
AB: “There are also cameras outside, in the shuttle bay when it’s open …” 
 
DA: “Right.” 
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AB: “… and they look at the Earth’s horizon, and the Earth, and they get all 
kinds of views.  After all folks – if those things are really going on – these 
things we see, they would have to see them, wouldn’t they?” 

 
DA: “And I believe the evidence is that they have.  And all of these images – if 

a picture is taken and it’s transmitted back to ground control, well that 
comes down through the ether and can be received by satellite – by 
receiving dishes on Earth. 
 

AB: “That’s right.” 
 

* * * 
AB: “The audience should understand … there’s something called NASA 

Select – and I can receive it here on C-Band … [and in the past it was not 
tape-delayed] …  You received live transmissions from the shuttle, and 
this man [who DS investigated] apparently was dedicated to recording 
them.” 

 
DS: Despite this, I undertook an investigation of NASA Select footage.  Martin 

Stubbs was the man, who “spent six (6) or seven (7) years of his life 
recording live NASA broadcasts, cataloging what appeared to be UFOs … 

 So I started studying them, and I started writing to scientists at NASA and 
talking to other physicists about them.  I had a lot of knowledge in science 
and physics myself from being a fly on the wall to many Nobel Prize 
winning physicists (!) and having them at my disposal.”  DS spoke to Dr. 
Earl Vanlandingham (NASA propulsion energy), Dr. Joseph Nuth III 
(NASA astrochemistry), Dr. Lou[is] Frank (award-winning astrophysicist), 
Astronaut Edgar Mitchell, “and any number of other physicists … ,” so that 
I was sharing the footage with them “and looking for answers.” 

 
DA: “And on the footage – and the reason [?] made this inquiry is because it is 

very, very compelling … you see the NASA – this particular piece from 
STS-79 [sic] …” 

 
AB: “He says 75 …” 
 
DA: “The one that’s really compelling is the one with the tether of the satellite 

that breaks off.” 
 
AB: “Oh, that’s incredible!” 
 
DA: “You see the shuttle, it releases the satellite – a tethered satellite hopefully 

to go up and get into the trajectory that they wanted to achieve, but there 
was a mistake … and the tether broke, correct David?” 

 
DS: “That is correct.” 
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DA: “So you see the satellite come out, you see the tether which is long, a mile 

long …” 
 
DS: “Twelve miles long.” 
 
DA: “Twelve (12) miles long, the tether, and it breaks away and floats away 

from the space shuttle to a distance of about what?” 
 
DS: “Starting camera is about seventy-seven (77) miles away drifting to a 

hundred (100).” 
 
DA: “Right.  So you see this long, long glowing straight cord – which is the 

tether – and that’s the phenomenon you see …” 
 
AB: “Glowing is right.” 
 
DA: “And then in the background, slowly these objects begin to float in behind 

this twelve (12) mile long tether, which is a hundred (100) miles away.  
And these objects are round, with a hole in the middle, and a notch in the 
side …” 

 
AB: “That’s right.” 
 
DA: “Like the … the same symmetry as the Dropa Stone.” 
 
DS: “And they also … when I freeze frame these pulsing phenomenal disks, I 

get a spiraling wave, exactly showing all three (3) phenomena … matching 
the Dropa Stone.” 

 
AB: “And I suppose both of you are aware of some of the astounding UFO 

sightings in Europe that show exactly what you’re talking about … with a 
notch and all …” 

 
DA: “Exactly, there’s a woman in England who has seen them a couple of 

times …” 
 
AB: “That’s right, that’s right …  And she caught a heluva photo and I think she 

sold it to somebody for television.” 
 
DS: “Yeah, that was Robert Kiviat.” … 
 
AB: “Kiviat, that’s right.” 
 
DA: “Now David, the dimensions of these craft … as you look at this footage, 

what does it seem the dimensions of these craft are?” 
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DS: “… I’ve done very deep research at NASA into this …” 
 
DA: “It’s all on tape, folks – it’s all on tape.” 
 
DS: “It’s all on tape.” … 
 
DA: “Your measurements are taken how?” … 
 
DS: “Well, first of all, the tether is twelve (12) miles long …” 
 
AB: “So you’ve got a reference?” 
 
DS: “You’ve got relativity.” 
 
AB: “Sure.” 
 
DS: First of all, the objects are going in and out behind the tether, so it’s not an 

optical illusion. 
 
DA: “Many, many of them, David.” 
 
DS: “There’s many of them!  And the largest, measuring the diameters of the 

UFOs against the twelve (12) mile long tether, I estimate two (2) to three 
(3) miles in diameter minimum sizes.  And if they’re farther behind the 
tether than I think, they could be much larger than that even.” 

 
AB: “But at minimum …” 
 
DS: “Two (2) to three (3) miles wide.” 
 
AB: “These are Big, Big Objects. …  Now, let’s backtrack just a little bit …  The 

tether broke – now, it was a fascinating experiment, that as far as I know 
they have not yet repeated – who knows why?” 

 
DA: “It was an energy-gathering thing, right?” 
 
AB: “It sure was.  And as a matter of fact, they gathered so much energy, 

when we say the tether broke, that’s not exactly what occurred.” 
 
DS: “No, that’s not exactly what occurred.  What occurred was … they ran a 

charge of electricity through [the tether], just like they would charge any 
antenna.  And they were trying to produce energy, as the antenna 
dragged through the Earth’s ionosphere” for highly-charged particles …” 
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AB: “And what they got was so much more than they expected, that it just 
literally melted.” 

 
DS: “Exactly.” 
 
AB: “It melted.  So you might speculate – at least I might – that these beings 

were aware that we were on the precipice of discovering a new energy 
source, that might change this planet forever.  That’s what I think, 
personally.” 

 
DS: “Well that’s what NASA discovered … space has a lot more energy …  In 

fact, in the tether the measurements were ten (10) times what physicists 
had predicted …” 

 
AB: “Thank you.” 
 
DS: “So there’s a lot more energy in the ‘zero’ of space, that’s now called the 

Quantum Void, than scientists had ever previously thought.  And that 
energy field in space may be what some of these ‘great civilizations’ from 
other star systems are tapping into to traverse the great distances of our 
Universe.” 

 
AB: “Well, maybe they’re not for us to tap into, just yet.” 
 
DA: “Maybe not … that could be part of it, but also there seems there’s a 

benevolent intervention here …  David, in your book, you go on to 
postulate a theory as to why these crafts are visiting our outer 
atmospheres – the ionosphere, stratosphere, and that would be why?  
Why is this particular species with this particular craft – what are they 
doing with these huge … are they just observing?  Or are they acting on a 
benevolent impulse here?” 

 
DS: I’d have to backtrack to answer that … 
 
AB: “David, David, you’re going to have to hold it right there – this really is an 

interesting point to hold it too …  And this footage exists, as a matter of 
fact, he’s got tapes that you can get your hands on …  You really should 
see if for yourself.  Seeing is believing!” 

 
* * * 

AB: “Well, it has to be that NASA knows these things are there, so that means 
they’re lying to us (!)  They’re not telling us the truth.  And the question 
would be ‘Why?’  Why would they lie to us?  And I’m sure we’ll cover that 
shortly with these two gentlemen – Dan Aykroyd, the Dan Aykroyd, and 
David Sereda are my guests, and they’ll be right back …” 
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* * * 
AB: “Gentlemen, welcome back.  We’re talking about these balls of water, or I 

suppose if they were in space – ice – and water when they get here, 
crashing into Earth.  David …” 

 
DS: “Yes, that’s where we left off. …” 
 
DA: “David, you were in correspondence with this Dr. Nuth …  Now, how did 

you find out about this NASA research which was revealing knowledge of 
these huge balls of water coming into the atmosphere and avoiding 
satellites and avoiding shuttles – and somehow, seemingly being directed. 

 
 What was the origin of the NASA study?  Maybe we can start there.” 
 
DS: “In about 1985 Dr. Louis A. Frank was operating satellites so they could 

see into the ultraviolet spectrum.  Incidentally, the ultraviolet light spectrum 
is the spectrum of light that we can’t see as humans – it’s too high in 
energy for us to see.” 

 
 Via cameras aimed at our upper atmosphere, Dr. Frank detected moving 

objects of light and they were showing up only in the ultraviolet spectrum. 
 “Something that no one else in the history of space science has observed 

ever … ever!” 
 
 DS asked Dr. Vanlandingham in 1989 if NASA had ever made contact 

with an extraterrestrial civilization.  Vanlandingham took the question very 
seriously, and denied it (!)  [DS quoting Vanlandingham]:  ‘No, we haven’t.  
When you consider the amount of energy it takes for a spacecraft to do 
the speed of light – to arrive at Earth from another star system … it takes 
a tremendous amount of energy to get velocity in a spacecraft.” 

 
 Then of course, you have the problem of Einstein’s law of relativity.  DS 

details the problem of the impeding force of inertia in space.  You need to 
change the “solid structure of the spacecraft and turn it into light – turn it 
into actual energy.” … 

 
DA: “Make it vibrate at a higher light.” 
 
DS: “At a higher level.” 
 
AB: “Actually I thought Einstein suggested that if you did achieve the speed of 

light that is exactly what would happen.” 
 
DS: “That’s exactly … and you’re right … that’s the next evolution of it.  If you 

did achieve the speed of light, you would literally have to transform into 
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light.” …  If a photon achieves the speed of light, it’s because it is a mass-
less particle. 

 
 According to Dr. Earl Vanlandingham, Director of Propulsion and Energy 

at NASA, when you consider the great amounts of energy it takes to 
achieve the speed of light, “we would detect a signal well in advance of 
the arrival of a spacecraft.” … 

 
 “Where we should be looking to see greater energy signals is not down in 

radio where SETI is looking, but up into the visible, the near ultraviolet, the 
far ultraviolet, the extreme ultraviolet and even higher into X-ray and 
Gamma-Ray waves – and that’s exactly where NASA’s looking.” 

 
AB: “SETI is also moving in that direction.” 
 
DS: “Everyone’s starting to figure this out now, because when you take the 

energy part of the equation that both Einstein and Earl Vanlandingham are 
stating to us – we need to be looking at higher energy signals.  And so 
NASA’s video cameras on the space shuttle, which all its footage of the 
tether was taken on … they basically take an off-the-shelf video camera 
and then ‘soup it up’ kind of like you would a hot-rod car, to see into the 
near ultraviolet light system.  So when something only shows up in the 
ultraviolet light spectrum, it means that the entirety of the object – every 
single atom is vibrating as pure wave-form energy, in a spectrum of 
energy that is actually radiating with so much energy that we can’t see it. 

 
 That’s exactly what … in regards to what Vanlandingham is saying, where 

we should be looking to detect such a signal, and that’s exactly where 
these UFOs are showing up.” 

 
AB: “All right.  So how are they explaining this?” 
 
DS: “Now when he [Dr. Frank] started to find these ‘water balls’ only showing 

up in the ultraviolet spectrum …” 
 
DA: “Going thirty-five thousand (35,000) miles an hour and hitting our upper 

atmospheres.” 
 
DS: “Hitting our upper atmosphere, doing thirty-five thousand (35,000) miles 

an hour …  I went ‘Oh my God!  This meets the criteria of unidentified 
flying objects …’” 

 
AB: “Sure.” 
 
DS: “… and all this for what we should be looking for.  And then I got in the 

middle of this huge debate between [Lou Frank, Joseph Nuth, and other 
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scientists] at NASA trying to find out what these things were.  And that’s 
where it all began ….  What we ended up with was a war!  On one hand 
Frank really did appear to be seeing giant ‘water balls’ entering our upper 
atmosphere, but on the other hand, there were so many of them – and 
they weren’t showing up on infrared, which they should – which showed 
me they were highly quantized [sic?] foreign objects, and then Nuth was 
pulling his hair out of his head, because he said with this many objects 
impacting our atmosphere – no satellite, no other space shuttle has a 
chance of surviving days, let alone years, if these are actually naturally-
occurring water balls called ‘small comets.’  And so there’s a huge 
disagreement. 

 
 The only answer in the end that I could come up with in the debate was 

that these water balls were being intelligently directed around the 
satellites, and that was … the only answer to explain why they aren’t 
hitting them.” … 

 
AB: “Is it so hard to imagine after all, there’s a very strong theory that that’s the 

way life was seeded originally on Earth?” 
 

DS: “Water is the matrix of all life …” 
 
AB: “You bet.” 
 
DS: “Everything is made of water.  And then the other part of the problem was 

that water cannot survive deep transits in space.  Not small amounts of 
water like this …” 

 
AB: “Right.” 
 
DS: “… without burning up under the intensely hot rays of ultraviolet and 

gamma rays, and X-rays.  In fact, it shouldn’t even be here. 
 
 So then I postulated to Nuth that the only possible answer is that they had 

a phenomenal membrane around them kind of like a radiant barrier …  
The only way we could see these water balls surviving [in space] is if they 
had a barrier around them, and that would start to look like some sort of 
an intelligence, and that’s something that NASA could not agree to, so the 
debate has remained stagnant to this day. 

 
 I filled in the blanks.  The answer was clear to me.  The only way that 

there could be so many of them impacting our atmosphere and not hitting 
the satellites is for 1) They were going around them; and 2) They must 
have had some sort of a thin or protective shell, and that starts to lend to 
the idea that we’re dealing with intelligence.” 
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AB: “Yes, but NASA then is well aware of this and all of the other NASA 
footage, that I’m sure Dan has seen a lot of and I’ve seen it too.  You can’t 
watch this footage without your mind getting blown and you’re saying to 
yourself – ‘Well then, we’re being lied to.’” 

 
DA: “I think that the rank-and-file of NASA – I think there are many there who 

are big fans of the footage.  It’s known that many were big fans of the 
Mission to Mars movie, which laid out and postulated the seeding 
scenario, and I think that your public relations mechanism at NASA is just 
operating under the … is it the Space Act of 1958, David?” 

 
DS: “Yeah, exactly.  It was the Space Act of 1958.” 
 
DA: “You know government employees and people in aerospace and 

astrophysics, and people in the military are prohibited by United States 
Code … from talking about UFOs.” 

 
AB: “Well, I had two (2) NASA public relations guys on the air with me, and it 

was very instructive.  Their answers were very instructive in essentially 
denying everything (!)  It was an obvious, full-blown ‘We’re going to deny 
everything:  ice crystals, propulsion – any reason at all one can give, the 
reasons they do give – and they just flat denied everything.’” 

 
* * * 

DA: “And why are they being hurled at us by this intelligent … ?” 
 
DS: “Okay, so this gets incredibly interesting, because again, I didn’t know 

where this investigation was going ….”  Dr. Nuth said that Dr. Frank’s 
hypothesis was impossible, because the ‘water balls’ could not survive the 
long voyage through space.  They were also not ‘tailings’ (droppings) off a 
passing comet, because they existed even when no comet was passing 
by.  Also not space debris or space junk. 

 
 But then DS asked Dr. Nuth if the ‘water balls’ would contribute to the 

replenishing of Earth’s ozone layer … ?  Nuth admitted they would, but 
was not sure how much.  [Yet Dr. Nuth also denied it was even happening 

 in the first place – JS]. 
 
AB: “We do know how serious the ozone depletion is becoming.  Three to five 

percent (3%-5%) over the North American continent, for example.  Zillions 
more cancers – all kinds of problems as a result of it.” 

 
DS: “Exactly.”  According to calculations made by one scientist at NASA ‘life 

could end on this planet within thirty (30) years – and that was from about 
fifteen (15) years ago. …  We don’t have to lose all of the ozone for life to 
end, we only have to lose some of it.  And yet this hasn’t happened … so 
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I’m quite interested – I don’t know how much ozone these things are 
producing, but it seems to be an act of benevolence …” 

 
 Later DS made the connection of the ‘water balls’ to the Dropa Stones, 

and then the connection to the Sirius star system.  “And here was my 
answer (!) – the  ancient Sirian gods were known as the masters of water, 
as the ‘Water Gods.’”  They were from a watery planet in the Sirius star 
system.  “And everything came crashing together.” 

 
 “The Dogon tribe in northwest Africa prophecy the return of the Sirian 

gods.  The day of the return would be called ‘Day of the Fish’ … to 
describe the aquatic or watery nature of these gods.” 

 
* * * 

AB: “Where were we?” 
 
DA: “We have got a Dropa stone in an ancient culture that is like a lifesaver 

with a notch cut out of it.  We have a picture that a woman took in England 
of such a craft in the sky.  We have the NASA STS-75 – their own 
cameras recording the tether with these objects in the background – looks 
like a lifesaver with a notch cut out of it.  We have ‘water balls’ hitting the 
planet, producing ozone, and to hopefully heal the atmosphere … and in 
this theory of the Sirian connection …” 

 
AB: “Dan, how much trouble do you think we’re in environmentally?” 
 
DA: “Well, when you’ve got frogs missing limbs and growing extra limbs, and 

missing eyes and [growing] tumors …, when you have species dying out 
around the world … in formerly pristine areas like rain forests and jungles, 
when you have acid rain eating the paint off my farmhouse … air pollution 
at such degrees now that even towns along here where we are in Lake 
Ontario are suffering (formerly they didn’t have that kind of a problem) … 
you know I think we are in … we’re probably … we are a minute from 
midnight – and midnight being catastrophe(!)” 

 
AB: “The weather would also seem to be undergoing a fairly profound change 

at the moment …” 
 

* * * 
DS: “The ancient Egyptian gods and goddesses were known as “the masters 

of water.” …  “Many of NASA’s scientists [were] trying to slough these 
things off as so many explainable phenomena.” 

 
AB: “Yeah, but here’s the problem David and Dan – it’s this, and I’ve talked to 

NASA people, and I tell them about the kind of thing we’re talking about 
right now, and they say:  ‘My God, if NASA knew of something like this ... 
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going on – extraterrestrials visiting us – we would be the very first to tell 
you about it, because we depend on a budget, and nothing would get our 
budget going like discovery of extraterrestrials ...” 

 
DS: These people are not trained to look for a high-energy signal ... They don’t 

understand what they are seeing. 
 
DA: “It would be very difficult I think for the conventional publicity mechanism 

of NASA to present this theory and have it be believed.” 
 
DS: “Yeah, they’d have a hard time of it, they would.” 
 
AB: “Yes, but we have this evidence of these craft traversing our atmosphere 

at twenty-five thousand (25,000) miles an hour ...  There’s pretty 
impressive radar confirmations and visual confirmations, and photographs 
and all the rest of it, so somebody there has to know something ...” 

 
DS: “I think they know, Art. ...”  DS describes Richard Hoagland as a ‘profound 

research scientist.’  DS then details the ‘Pegasus Incident.’  DS is “looking 
for a high-energy signal of something that doesn’t appear in lower 
dimensions.” 

 
AB: “I don’t think there’s a big argument ...” 
 
DS: “Per Einstein’s law, a solid craft can’t do the speed of light, but if you turn it 

into pure energy, you can!  That’s what we should be looking for ...” 
 
DA: “How does that happen?  How do we take mass and turn it into light?  And 

how is it possible that from eight and a half (8.5) light years away, these 
craft are able to make this journey in much less time than that?” 

 
DS: I treat that with respect in the book and the video. 
 
 DS studied ‘wave patterns’ from an ‘incredible good quality’ VCR tape (!)  

DS references the ‘Hutchison Effect.’  Hutchison levitated ‘common balls’ 
via pulsating high frequency waves. 

 
AB: Can you explain how craft “come into the visual spectrum for a period of 

time and then eventually ‘wink-out,’ and then may appear again later an 
impossible distance away?” 

 
DS: DS explains that the craft transform their mass into a high-frequency wave 

state, “mass becomes energy … and is basically transforming into light.”  
It becomes lighter and lighter in mass …  “And once it becomes as light as 
a photon, it easily does the speed of light – in fact, it requires very little 
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energy in the form of propulsion to move a solid spacecraft made of 
photons, made of light, because they have no mass.” 

 
AB: “Is it your opinion … that what’s going on at Area 51 and other secret 

areas is experimentation in exactly this technology?” 
 
DA: “Probably not as advanced as this.” 
 
DS: “Probably not as advanced, but I can tell you one thing about Area 51 that 

I’ve done some research into, and that is a company called EG and G …” 
 
AB: “Oh, I know them well …” 
 
DS: “In 1968 [EG and G] boasted that they had a successful demonstration of 

a nuclear propulsion system called ‘Phobos 2A.’ …  That would be a 
radioactive nuclear propulsion system.  Because we know we haven’t truly 
developed nonradioactive nuclear propulsion systems yet.” 

 
AB: “We think we haven’t anyway …” 
 
DS: “I’ve worked with some of the top nuclear fusion scientists in the world … 

and there is definitely ‘retardation’ in our country in to funding truly 
nonradioactive nuclear types of fusion … we haven’t gone there yet.” … 
Nonradioactive nuclear energy and magnetism beyond light speed craft 
are obviously far beyond nuclear fusion. … 

 
AB: “I think we’re on to this technology to some degree, I just think that it’s 

being suppressed.” 
 
DS: “We are … and we’re heading in the right direction, but we’re slow … very, 

very slow.” 
 

* * * 
DA: “Art, in answer to your question about ‘Why don’t they reveal this?’ – Why 

there’s no open discussion of these matters …  Well, there was a 
congressional study done in the Fifties [1950’s] about what this knowledge 
would do to western society, and, you know it was concluded in that study 
that there’d be a general breakdown of respect for authority.” 

 
AB: “Umm-hmm.” 
 
DS: “That’s the Brookings Report …” 
 
AB: “Yes, of course.” 
 



ART BELL FILES RADIO ARCHIVES 

© 2001 Premiere Networks Inc. 
The Art Bell Vault has vintage, commercial-free AB audios at coasttocoastam.com/sign-up 

21 

DA: “We’re supposed to support the teacher and the cop on the street, the 
military man and the President when there’s a higher being – and a higher 
force out there?  Wait a minute, hold on …  Get out of here!  Get out of the 
way!  We want to talk to Him!  We want to talk to that Entity.” 

 
AB: “Yes, right.” 
 
DA: “You have that breakdown of society, that disrespect for authority – people 

not going to work, people not going to church (!) – well, this is the theory 
anyway …  I think at this point – today in the year 2001, with all that’s 
happening on the planet …  With fifty percent (50%) of the people in polls 
taken all the time believing in paranormal and supernatural events, that 
there is much more beyond the four (4) dimensions that we live in …  

 
AB: “You bet!” 
 
DA: “… much more than we see – I think people are ready to handle it!  And I 

think that that Brookings Report was done half a century ago and times 
have changed, technology’s changed, and I think people are ready for a 
revelation …” 

 
AB: “Well, to some degree perhaps, Dan, but I tell you I talk to a number of 

fundamentalists on this program all the time – they’re not ready … !” 
 
DA: “But it’s all from God!  It all comes from God!  It all comes from the Divine 

Being …  It doesn’t undermine God in any way.  I don’t see where it 
undermines God or anything Judeo-Christian at all!” 

 
* * * 

AB: “Do you believe in [ghosts]?” 
 
DA: “Oh yes, absolutely!”  Took a bike [Harley] ride up through Louisiana to 

Mississippi’s Myrtles Plantation.  DA took photos of ghosts there.  DA has 
also spoken to U.S. park rangers at Ellis Island, New York, who report 
they heard voices, felt cold spots, and saw ghosts in the parapets there 
late at night.  Also, “Hans Holzer was a great researcher of all this … he’s 
got audiotapes of otherworldly voices … that are – just again, compelling 
evidence.” 

 
AB: “Well, I agree with you … I too believe in ghosts.  I’ve heard the stories for 

years and years and years … so compelling!  I’ve seen a lot of very 
compelling photographs. … So, I believe …” 

 
* * * 

DS: “The founding fathers of our Constitution were all Masons.” 
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* * * 
DA: “What about [NASA’s] quest for ‘zero-point energy’?  Do you think there’s 

any evidence … ?” 
 
DS: NASA opened up a new division for research into zero-point energy in 

1996, but DS does not know why this happened or what’s behind it. 
 

* * * 
AB: “The people who would have seen a lot of this are … the astronauts.  

Now, the astronauts – including those who went to the Moon – have all 
had incredibly difficult lives since their missions.  As though they are 
aware of something and they’re keeping it inside.  I mean, they have had 
bouts with alcoholism at just an astounding rate.  Loss of families, 
divorces, all kinds of very difficult things have happened to these guys 
who have had ‘The Right Stuff.’” 

 
DA: “But a few have come out and said that they’ve seen things.” 
 
AB: “Yes sir, they have!” 
 

* * * 
DA: “Anybody who comes up to me and says:  ‘Well, how can you believe in 

ghosts, the supernatural, and the paranormal?  What proof is there?’  I say 
– ‘Well go to Marfa, Texas ...’” 

 
AB: “Oh yes, the Marfa lights.” 
 
DA: “Go thirty (30) miles west of Alpine and park your car at the state-certified 

paranormal mystery parking lot, ‘cause the State of Texas has right there 
Marfa Mystery Lights ... and watch these lights.  And they appear every 
night between dusk and dawn, and they hop around and change colors ... 
I’ve sighted them with an infrared viewer, I’ve seen them with the naked 
eye, I’ve had people with me ... the thing is there’s nothing out there to 
produce them (!)  There’s no gas, it not a car, it’s not a generator ...” 

 
AB: “But they’re there.” 
 
DA: “They’re there.  And that is a true paranormal mystery and one recognized 

by the State of Texas.” 
 
AB: “And by the way, here in Nevada ...  we’ve got something called the 

‘Extraterrestrial Highway.’” 
 
DA: “Recognized by the State of Nevada.” 
 
AB: “That’s right.” 
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DA: “I almost hit a cow there a couple years ago on a motorcycle going up to 

the ‘Little A’Le’Inn.’” 
 
AB: “Oh, yes ...  Oh, you’ve been there?” 
 
DA: “I’ve been to Rachel.  Seen the mailbox. ...” 
 

* * * 
AB: “I think that the Brookings Institution study is still in force.  And I believe 

that at the highest levels in this country they’ve determined that this 
information cannot get out.  Simply cannot get out. ...  And if it’s really this 
serious, they’re not gonna let this get out, not to the point where there’s a 
public epiphany, you know, and everybody suddenly realizes it really is 
true.  They’re just not ... they can’t let it happen!” ... 

 
DS: “So many people stay up so late at night, because they want to know the 

truth.” 
 

* * * 
AB: “Dan, you’re lending your celebrity, your voice, to this cause, so you must 

feel awfully strongly about it.” 
 
DA: “Well, I do ... I like truth to be told, and you know, there are thousands and 

thousands of people out there, around the world who’ve been taken – and 
we haven’t even gotten into that phenomenon, and to the work of Budd 
Hopkins and John Mack. ...  And these are people from all walks of life.” 

 
 DA lists Herb Shirmer from Nebraska, Barney and Betty Hill, the Allagash 

guys, the Pascagoula guys, the Hopkinsville Incident ...  There are people 
out there who know.” 

 
AB: “Are you pretty well convinced, Dan, that these creatures have our best 

interests at heart?”  Or there’s people like Dr. David Jacobs, who write: 
‘They may not be who we think they are.’ ... 

 
[DA’s phone cut out] 

 
AB: “Are you familiar with the work of Dr. David Jacobs?” 
 
DA: “I’m not sure.” 
 
AB: “Well, it’s simple.  He doesn’t think these are such friendly creatures at all.  

And he thinks those who have been abducted have been brainwashed ...  
Now you obviously seem to think they’re pretty friendly ...” 
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DA: “Only the ones David [DS] writes about – the Sirian theory.  Those are 
benevolent species ...” 

 
 “I think there are training programs underway in the military with a 

defensive stance – and there probably should be.” 
 
 “Now Steven Greer says we should not be developing the missile defense 

shield, we should not be developing space-oriented weapons at all 
because they, I guess, will act as a deterrent to those coming down to try 
to make contact. ...  Well, I [DA] think it helps to have something in 
reserve.” 

 
AB: “Dr. Greer thinks it’s crazy to be developing space-based weapons 

systems and he thinks we’ve been shooting at these things!” 
 

* * * 
DA: The Europeans are more open about these things. 
 
AB: “Yeah, they talk about it – we don’t. ...  It is really happening, you know.” 
 

* * * 
 


